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On the morning of August 6, 1945, an atomic bomb was dropped on the
city of Hiroshima, Japan. The explosion killed an estimated 140,000 people
and caused widespread devastation. In the years that followed, the
survivors of the bombing have shared their stories with the world, in an
effort to ensure that such a tragedy never happens again.

One such survivor is Rahna Reiko Rizzuto, the author of the book
Hiroshima in the Morning. Rizzuto was just two years old when the bomb
was dropped, but she has spent her life learning about the bombing and its
aftermath. In her book, Rizzuto draws from personal interviews with
survivors, diaries, and official documents to paint a vivid and deeply moving
portrait of the lives that were lost, the families that were shattered, and the
resilience of the people who survived to rebuild their lives.
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Hiroshima in the Morning is a powerful and unforgettable account of one of
the darkest chapters in human history. Through the eyes of the survivors,
Rizzuto tells a story of unimaginable suffering, loss, and hope. Her book is
a must-read for anyone who wants to understand the full impact of the
atomic bomb and its legacy.

A Haunting and Unforgettable Journey

Hiroshima in the Morning is a haunting and unforgettable journey through
history. Rizzuto's writing is clear and concise, and she has a gift for bringing
the past to life. The book is filled with vivid descriptions of the bombing and
its aftermath, and Rizzuto does not shy away from the gruesome details.
However, she also tells a story of hope and resilience. The survivors of
Hiroshima have endured unimaginable suffering, but they have also shown
incredible strength and determination. Their stories are a testament to the
human spirit.

A Must-Read for Anyone Who Wants to Understand the Full Impact of
the Atomic Bomb

Hiroshima in the Morning is a must-read for anyone who wants to
understand the full impact of the atomic bomb and its legacy. Rizzuto's
book is a powerful and moving account of one of the darkest chapters in
human history. It is a story that will stay with you long after you finish
reading it.

About the Author

Rahna Reiko Rizzuto is an award-winning journalist and author. She has
written extensively about the atomic bombing of Hiroshima and its
aftermath. Her work has appeared in The New York Times, The



Washington Post, and The Atlantic. She is the author of several books,
including Hiroshima in the Morning and Why Hiroshima?.
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